
 

 

 
 

No NEIGR/ENGG/116/2022/                            Dated the 12
th

 January, 2023 

 

NOTICE INVITING QUOTATION 

 

On behalf of the Institute, Sealed quotations for Dismantling of Brick Wall , painting , varnishing 

etc of the existing squash court are invited from registered contractors for the following work upto 

23rd January, 2023 by 2:00 P M and the same will be opened on the same date and time as per 

details below: 
 

Sl No Name of work Estimated cost E M D  

1 
Dismantling of Brick Wall, painting, varnishing 

etc of the existing squash court 
Rs.98,457/- Rs.1,970/- 

 

Terms and conditions:  
 

1. NEIGRIHMS reserves the right to accept or reject any or all quotation without assigning 

any reason thereof. 

2. EMD in form of FDR / call deposit / Banker’s Cheque in favour of Deputy Director (Admn) 

NEIGRIHMS 

3. If the contractor fails to complete the execution and completion of the works as specified in 

the letter of award and if extension of time is not granted, if any, the contractor shall be 

bound to pay a liquidated damages a sum of 0.5% (percent) per week of delay for such 

default subject to a maximum of 5% of the contract price. 

4. The quotation should be submitted in a sealed cover and superscripted with the name of 

work addressed to the Executive Engineer (Civil), NEIGRIHMS 

5. The rate should be inclusive of all taxes and duties. 

6. Performance Security @ 3% if applicable will have to be submitted by the lowest 

quotationer. 

7. The variation in quantity may be within +/- 15% of the quantity. 

 

Interested bidders may submit their quotations as per the price bid format at Annexure - I at the 

Office of the Undersigned upto 1400 hrs on 23rd January, 2023 

 

 

 

 

Executive Engineer 

NEIGRIHMS 

 

Copy to:  1. Notice Board 

  2. Office file  

 



 

 

 

 

 

Annexure – I 

 

Name of the Work: - Dismantling of Brick Wall, painting, varnishing etc of the existing squash court 

 

Sl 
N
o 

Description Unit Quantity Rate Amount 

1 
Demolishing brickwork including stacking of serviceable 
materials and disposal of unserviceable materials as directed for 
all levels 

Cum 5.934   

2 

Wall painting (one coat) with acrylic emulsion paint approved 
brand and manufacture (Asian paint/ Berger paint/ ICI paint/ J & 
N paint/ Nerolac) on old wall surface to give an even shade after 
thoroughly brushing the surfaces free from mortar droppings and 
other foreign matter and sand papered smooth 

Sqm 252.45   

3 

Extra over item no 2 above for every subsequent coat of wall 
painting with acrylic emulsion paint of approved brand and 
manufacture (Asian paint/ Berger paint/ ICI paint/ J & N paint/ 
Nerolac) 

Sqm 252.45   

4 

Extra over item no 2 above for painting with acrylic emulsion 
paint of approved brand and manufacture (Asian paint/ Berger 
paint/ ICI paint/ J & N paint/ Nerolac) on celling and on sloping 
roof 

Sqm 68.31   

5 

Varnishing two coats (excluding priming coat) on new wood and 
wood based surfaces under coating with flatting varnish and 
finishing coat with copal varnish or spar varnish to give an even 
surface including cleaning the surface of all dirt, dust and filling 
the knots, crack etc. with specially made wood putty and sand 
papering so as to produce a smooth, dry and matt surface 

Sqm 68.31   

6 

15 mm thick Cement plaster in single coat on rough side of 
single or half brick wall for interior plastering up to 1st floor level 
including arises, internal rounded angles, not exceeding 80mm 
girth and finished even and smooth including curing complete as 
directed   b) In cement mortar 1:4 

Sqm 6.00   

 

 

 

 

 

 

Signature of Contractor 

 

 

 

 


